Award Memo & Checklist

Contract #10012 – Weekend Transportation Services
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Award Memo & Checklist

Contract 10012- Weekend Transportation Services for the Washington State Center for Childhood Deafness and Hearing Loss, and Washington State School for the Blind
Procurement Coordinator:  Connie Stacy
	Contract Type:
	 FORMCHECKBOX 
 New   FORMCHECKBOX 
 Rebid    FORMCHECKBOX 
 Replacement   FORMCHECKBOX 
 WSCA   FORMCHECKBOX 
 Enterprise   FORMCHECKBOX 
 General Use
 FORMCHECKBOX 
Restricted to: CDHL and WSSB

	Contract Duration:
	Initial Term: two years (08/01/13 thru 07/31/15)
Maximum life: six years
Maximum Date:  07/31/19

	Estimated Value:
	Estimated Term Worth: $607,812/two years
Estimated Annual Worth: $303,906.00  

	Bidders:
	Number of Bidders notified: 170
MWBE’s notified: 2
Bids received: 3
Bids Rejected: 1 (A&A Motorcoach provided three alternate bids in addition to the one considered responsive)

	Notification Method:
	 FORMCHECKBOX 
  WEBS, Customer ID 23363
 FORMCHECKBOX 
  Other

	NIGP Commodity Codes:
	 962-17, 962-16, 961-13 and 556-60

	Summary:
	This contract replaces Contract 01309 with Getaway Charters which was terminated in October, 2012 for contractor losing federal DOT certification status

	Bid Development

	Stakeholder work:
	 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Customer Forum
Worked extensively with the two sole users, WCCD and WSSB; in person, via email and via teleconference. Also spoke at length with local federal DOT regarding certification requirements and recommended School Bus Endorsement. Was referred to the federal Child Safety Coordinator who works for the Bonnie Lake Police Department to discuss recommendations (School Bus Endorsement)
 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Vendor Forum
Conducted a mandatory prebid conference at School for the Deaf, with a tour of it and the School for the Blind to familiarize prospective bidders with logistics. Three bidders were in attendance, A&A Motorcoach, Starline Luxury Coaches & MTR Transportation.

In addition, both schools were interested in incorporating a performance bond requirement, so worked with previous contractor A&A Motorcoach and their insurance company to determine cost and availability. It was subsequently determined to be too cost prohibitive (10% of contract value) and is not easily obtainable, both the insurance agent and our RISK management office advised is more for the Public Works industry.

	Market Research:
	Visited websites of numerous charter bus companies, reviewed previous bid process, spoke with USDOT, worked with end users knowledgeable of industry/service types

	EPP Strategy:
	IFB contained clause entitled “Economic and Environmental Goals”. As an added “value incentive” one of the successful bidders, A&A Motorcoach, proposed use of 22 passenger mini coaches for short route segments,  which will utilize less fuel than the standard 48 passenger charter bus, and also lessen carbon monoxide output. The 22 passenger are acceptable since they are equipped with the mandatory restrooms.

	Supplier Diversity Strategy:


	 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Is Certification language provided “Up Front” in the solicitation?
 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Did you include OMWBE in sourcing team?
 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Did you identify and remove barriers on this procurement?
 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Is a diversity plan included as part of the bid response prior to award (if certified firms are subcontractors)

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Does this procurement offer second tier opportunities and reporting. 
 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Did you encourage subcontracting efforts at the Prebid Conference?

	Strategy:
	It is DES’s intention that a price competition will best drive reasonable value, paving the way for customers and the state to meet current budget challenges

	Bid Development:
	Geographic considerations
Services required were identified as the “Northbound Route” and the “Eastbound Route”, and a split award consideration was incorporated due to the fact that very few of the qualified firms conduct both routes
Safety considerations:
Due to the nature of the service required  (transporting deaf and blind school age children home and back to school on weekends across the state), language was incorporated regarding requirement to be DOT certified, a School Bus endorsement and also we asked bidders to provide a written response to a couple of safety related scenarios.

	 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Peer Review
	Neva Peckham and Sarah Harris, previous contract administrators, Cheral Jones, Unit Manager. Also, extensive review and input by the CDHL and WSSB stakeholder team.

	 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Fee?
	.74% management fee

	Bid Process

	Bid Posted to WEBS:
	June 3, 2013

	Pre-Bid:

 
	Mandatory prebid conducted in Vancouver at the School for the Deaf on June 17, 2013 at 10:00 am. Three attendees; A&A Motorcoach, MTR Transportation & Starline Motorcoach. 

	Amendment(s):
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	Amendment One clarified the requirement for a School Bus Endorsement as well as the requirement for restrooms on all vehicles utilized. It also provided an updated Route list (which included the Pasco airport stop)


	Bid Evaluation—Responsiveness
Clarifications and acceptance of Bidder submittals, information, and product offerings were applied uniformly for all Bidders.

	Bid Opening:


	The bid opened July 3, 2013 at 2:00 pm and three (3) bids were received from:
(1) Starline; (2) MTR Western; and (3) A&A Motorcoach

	Bids Sealed & Signed?
	All 3 bids were received signed and sealed.

	Received all required submittals?
	All 3 bidders submitted required submittals.

	Specification compliance?
	All 3 complied with the required specifications.

1 bidder A&A Motorcoach also submitted three alternate bids which did not meet the required specifications - vehicles without restrooms for consideration, which were rejected.

	Price Sheet compliance?
	Yes, bidders complied with the price sheets, which offered the option of bidding either the NB or the EB route, or both. 

	Other Responsiveness checks?
	All three remaining Bidders provided all requested data with their bid and/or through clarification. No responsive issues were noted (All responsive).

	Rejected Bids:
	Sent rejection letter to A&A Motorcoach for three alternate bids not meeting the minimum specifications (restroom requirements). 

	Bid Evaluation—Scoring

	Cost and Non Cost Tabulation Sheet:  
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	Evaluation:
(Language from the IFB document)

	4.1 Non-COST factors EVALUATION process (appendix E)
There are four hundred (400) points available for “non-cost” factors, to be calculated for both the NBR and the EBR , which have been assigned as follows:

· Successful & Timely Resolution of Four Scenarios: 200 points total (50 points each)
· North or East Bound Route Stops & Times: 150 points
· Value Added Incentives:  50 points
Note:  DES may assemble and preside over an evaluation committee responsible for reviewing and scoring the “non-cost” responses.   Committee members may be substituted and/or the evaluation committee may be disbanded and reconstituted.

The committee will score the bidder responses consistent with their values.  

In addition to presiding over the evaluation committee, the Procurement Coordinator may review the “non-cost” responses, provide input, assemble evaluation aids, or perform other functions helpful to the evaluation committee.  The committee may engage in a free flow of discussion with other committee members and the Procurement Coordinator prior to, during, and after the evaluation.

The scoring of the questions may be performed in isolation or together as a group, or a combination of both.  Each committee member will score the responses to each question by assigning non-price points utilizing the point system identified below which has been established in accordance with primary stakeholder considerations.  

All of the committee members’ scores for a question will be added together and then divided by the number of members to calculate a point score for that question for each Bidder.  This process will be repeated for all questions and then each Bidder’s point scores for all questions will be summed to form non-cost point scores for each which will tabulated on a “non-cost” work sheet.

4.2 Cost Evaluation process (appendix C)
There are six hundred (600) points available for “cost” factors for each of the NBR and EBR  which have been assigned as follows:

· Northbound Route: 600 points or
· Eastbound Route: 600 points

For each type of equipment offered by the bidder, the “trip price” will be multiplied by the “number of anticipated trips for a single school year” to determine a “total price” by line item. Those line item total prices will then be added together to determine the “total cost” for each route.  Any applicable discount for prompt payment will then be applied. The bidder offering the lowest “total cost” per route will receive the maximum points available (600). Each successive bidder will then receive proportionately fewer points based upon their relationship to the lowest bidder; calculated as follows:

 EXAMPLE:

Luxury Charters is the lowest bidder offering a total price of $100,000.00 therefore receives 600 points for “cost”.

Sunshine Travel offers a total price of $120,000.00 which is 20% higher than Luxury Charter’s total price.  Sunshine Travel receives only 80% (100% - 20% = 80%) of the available points:  600 x .80 = 480 points. Sunshine Travel receives 480 points for “cost”.                  
4.3 FINAL SCORING 

Bidders “non-cost” scores will be combined with their “cost” score to determine their total number of points.

EXAMPLE:  NBR ROUTE:



Non-Cost Points
Cost Points
        Total Points
Luxury Charters


220

   600


    820

Sunshine Travel


400

   480


    880
4.4 Selection of Apparent Successful Bidder
The responsive and responsible Bidder who meets all of the RFP requirements and receives the highest evaluation point total by route will be deemed the Apparent Successful Bidder.

	Evaluators:

	Pursuant to Section 4.1 (outlined above), Stakeholder team of CDHL and WSSB evaluated and scored the “non-cost” portion.
Pursuant to Section 4.2 (outlined above), DES Procurement Coordinator evaluated and calculated the scores for “cost” portion.                  

	Clarifications:
	Received clarification from MTR that their bid price of $2,300.00/trip was for both NB routes 1 and 2 (since double that of their competitor) - Response was yes. 
Stakeholder team declined opportunity to pre-meet with either of the ASVs for any further clarifications. 

	Bid Evaluation—Responsibility

	Past Performance?
	As both proposed ASBs, A&A Motorcoach and MTR, are current providers to the school with no concerns/complaints received, customer agreed to forgo additional reference checks, as permitted by bid language.

	Qualifications?
	ASBs to provide required School Bus Endorsements upon award when the two firms have designated the drivers for the upcoming school year (see above).

	MWBE Participation: 


	Of the 3 bidders, __0_ were certified/self-identified minority-owned, _0_ were women-owned, and _0__ were veteran owned. 

	Conclusion/Scoring:
	Cost and Non-Cost Evaluation resulted in the following evaluation scores:

1. Eastbound Route
A&A Motorcoach = 920 points 

MTR Western = 400 points
2. Northbound Route 
MTR Western = 905.5 points
Starline =  366.5 points

	Results & Recommendation

	Recommendation:


	Based on the above, it is recommended that contracts be awarded to:

· Eastbound Route:  A&A Motorcoach - $142,906.00/school year

· Northbound Route: MTR Western - $161,000.00/school year

Anticipated initial two year term worth of $607,812.00. 

	Savings:


	Pursuant to customer estimates, new contract pricing is consistent with current prices for this service. Administrative savings to be achieved due to ASBs acceptance of PCard.

	Award Activities

	WEBS
	 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Notify bidders of the award via WEBS

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Once contract award has been finalized, archive bid in WEBS

	Communication
	 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Send rejection letter to those bidders to disqualified bidders

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Send apparent successful bidders announcement letter s
 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Send Award Announcement letters to all bidders <if applicable> 

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Email UM a brief award announcement for Bi-Weekly Broadcast

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Provided Debriefing to bidders upon request

	PCMS 
	 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Populate PCMS Info Tab 

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Complete PCMS Expanded Description Tab

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Add Web remark in the PCMS Remarks Tab announcing the award of the contract

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Complete PCMS Internet Tab to include relevant search terms 

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Complete PCMS Commodities Tab 

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Complete PCMS Vendors Tab 

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Complete PCMS Customer Tab 

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Complete PCMS Fees Tab 

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Complete PCMS WBE/MBE Percents

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Include relevant search terms in the PCMS Internet Tab

	Post Contract to DES Website

Link to: Current Contract Portal Training
	Copy the following files into the Shared Info\INTERNET folder:

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Copy Contract file (10012c.doc or pdf) 

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Copy the price sheet (10012p.doc or xls or pdf) 

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Copy the bid tab (10012t.doc or xls or pdf) 

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Copy the bid document (10012b.doc or xls, or pdf ) 
 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Copy the bid Amendment(s) (10012A.doc)

 FORMCHECKBOX 
 Copy the Award Memo to File document (10012m.doc)
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SOLICITATION AMENDMENT



RFP REFERENCE:	10012



                   TITLE:	Weekend Transportation Services for the Washington State Center for  

Childhood Deafness and Hearing Loss, and Washington State School for the Blind    



AMENDMENT #:	One



DATE ISSUED:		June 21, 2013



The above referenced solicitation is amended as follows:



PURPOSE:  	1. Provide updated Route and Times information (attached)

		2.  To add Pasco Airport to the Eastbound Route (see attached)

3. To reiterate/retain the requirement for drivers to possess a School Bus Endorsement, evidence of which is to be provided prior to the first day of transport if awarded a contract

4. To clarify that restrooms are required on all transportation vehicles (unless otherwise pre-approved by the customer agency)

5.  To provide a list of mandatory pre-bid conference attendees (attached)



Amendment does not need be submitted with proposal. All other terms, conditions, and specifications remain unchanged.



Previously scheduled opening date & time:			New opening date and time:        



                July 3, 2013 – 2:00 pm						unchanged







____________________________________			________________________

Signed (Connie Stacy, Contracts Specialist)			     Date               

















DEAF SCHOOL ONLY

    East #1

Monitors: Fri: 1 WSD Staff Sun: 1 WSD Staff

Leave/Arrive WSD: Fri: 11:30 AM  SUN: 7:30 PM



		

		Goldendale (Corner Chevron) 

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		821 E Simcoe Dr

		1:30pm

		5:15pm









		

		*Pasco/Walla Walla students board different bus

TOPPENISH (Branding Iron Café)

		2:30pm

		4:00pm







		

		YAKIMA (Gear Jammer Truck Plaza)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		2310 Rudkin Rd

		3:00 pm

		3:20 pm





		

		ELLENSBURG (McDonalds behind Mexican Rest.)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Exit # 109 

		3:45 pm

		3:00 pm





		

		GEORGE (Union 76)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Exit # 149

		4:30 pm

		2:10 pm





		

		WENATCHEE 

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Airport

		5:15 pm

		1:15 pm

 



		

		CHELAN (Wal-Mart)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		108 Apple Blossom Drive

		6:45 pm

		12:00 pm



		

		

		 

		







FRIDAY:  WSD Monitor is picked up at the school and dropped off at the Wenatchee Airport.

SUNDAY: WSD Monitor is picked up at Wenatchee Airport and rides the bus back to the school.



* Historically one charter bus for the east route arrives at the Deaf School to pick up all students and both monitors. After the stop at Goldendale, the bus continues and meets a second bus at Toppenish. The students and monitor assigned to the East 2 transfer to the waiting bus (East 2) effectively splitting the routes.  The return trip is similar; East 1 picks up the monitor (Wenatchee Airport) and the students along the way to Toppenish where it meets the East 2 bus that has picked up the monitor (Pasco Airport) and the students.  All students and the monitor from East 2 transfer to the East 1 bus and travel to Goldendale to pick up student(s) and then continue to the final destination – the School for the Deaf.  Nothing prevents the service provider from having two east buses for the entire trip. 			



















DEAF SCHOOL ONLY

East # 2

Monitors: Fri: 1 WSD Staff  Sun: 1 WSD Staff

Leave/Arrive WSD: Fri: 11:30 AM, SUN: 7:30 PM



-------------East 2 (after Toppenish)---------

		

		SUNNYSIDE (Shell Station)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Exit # 69

		3:00 pm

		3:45 pm









		

		PROSSER (Rest Area)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Exit # 80



		3:15 pm

		3:30 pm





		

		PASCO (McDonalds)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		2202 W. Court

		3:45 pm

		2:45 pm





		

		TOUCHET (Texaco/Subway)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		16284 Hwy 12

		4:45 pm

		2:00 pm



		

		

		

		









FRIDAY:  WSD Monitor is picked up at the school and dropped off at the Pasco Airport.
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SUNDAY: WSD Monitor is picked up at Pasco Airport and rides the bus back to the school.

DEAF and BLIND SCHOOLS



North #1

Monitors: Fri: 2 WSD STAFF and 1 WSSB Staff / Sun: 2 WSD STAFF and 1 WSSB

Leave/Arrive: Fri: 12:15 PM (SUN: 8:30 PM)



		

		KELSO (3 Rivers Mall – Target)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Exit # 39 – 

		1:05 pm

		7:30 pm





		

		CHEHALIS (Spiffy’s Restaurant)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		     Exit # 68

		1:40 pm

		7:05 pm





		

		    Centralia (Park n Ride)       TENINO                                                

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		    Exit #81 

		1:50 pm

		6:55 pm



		

		    LACEY (South Sound Mall – tree in front of Sears)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		    Exit #107/108

		2:25 pm

		6:05 pm



		

		

		

		

		



		

		TACOMA (Lowes)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Exit #128N/#129S

		3:10 pm

		5:30 pm



		

		

		

		

		







FRIDAY:  Students and monitors are picked up at both schools. The monitors return to their assigned schools on Friday night.

SUNDAY: The monitors are picked up and return with all the students to their assigned schools.





































DEAF and BLIND SCHOOLS



North #2    

Monitors: Fri, 2 WSD STAFF and 1 WSSB STAFF / Sun 2 WSD Staff and 1 WSSB STAFF 

Leave/Arrive Fri: 12:15 PM (SUN: 8:30 PM)

		[bookmark: _Hlk175630293]

		SOUTHCENTER (Double Tree)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Exit #153/154B

		3:00 pm

		5:15 pm





		

		LAKE FOREST PARK (McDonalds)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Exit #177

		4:15 pm

		4:20 pm





		

		EVERETT (Park N Ride)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		112th St freeway

		4:45 pm

		3:55 pm





		

		EVERETT (Union 76)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Exit # 193

		5:00 pm

		3:40 pm





		

		SMOKEY POINT (behind Rite Aid)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Exit #206

		5:20 pm

		3:15 pm





		

		MT. VERNON (Denny’s)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Exit #227

		5:45 pm

		3:00 pm





		

		Bellingham (Exxon Station)

		FRIDAY

		SUNDAY



		

		

		Exit #258 – Bennett Drive

		6:30 pm

		2:10 pm









FRIDAY:  Students and monitors are picked up at both schools. The monitors return to their assigned schools on Friday night.

SUNDAY: The monitors are picked up and return with all the students to their assigned schools.

            




Mandatory Prebid Conference Attendees 

June 17, 2013





		Name

		Representing



		Connie Stacy

		Department of Enterprise Services



		Jessica Sydnor

		CDHL/WSD



		Lorana Myers

		CDHL/WSD



		Sharon Caton

		CDHL/WSD



		Lori Pulliam

		WSSB



		Randy Ammerman

		A & A Motor Coach, Inc.



		Tom Casazza

		Starline Luxury Coaches



		Jennifer Cox

		MTR Western
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Sheet1

		RFP 10012 CHARTER BUS SERVICES

				"COST" (600 pts available)

				Bidder #1										Bidder #2										Bidder #3

				Starline										MTR Western										A & A Motorcoach

		PPD?		Net 30										Net 30										Net 30

		CC?		No										No										No

		CC accepted?		No (ACH)										Yes										Yes

				Northbound Rte:										Northbound Rte:										Northbound Rte:

				Equipment		Trip $		# Trips		Total				Equipment		Trip $		# Trips		Total				Equipment		Trip $		# Trips		Total

				Prevost H3 40 48 passenger		$1,376.00		77		$109,802.00				min 50 passenger		$2,300.00		70		$161,000.00				no bid						no bid

				(NBR #1)



				Prevost H3-40 48 passenger		$2,364.00		77		$183,028.00

				ADA equipped

				(NBR #2)				TOTAL:		$291,830.00								TOTAL:		$161,000.00								TOTAL:		no bid

																				(price confirmed)

				Eastbound Rte:										Eastbound Rte										Eastbound Rte:  Bid #1										Eastbound Rte: Bid #2										Eastbound Rte: Bid #3										Eastbound Rte: Bid #4

				Equipment		Trip $		# Trips		Total				Equipment		Trip $		# Trips		Total				Equipment		Trip $		# Trips		Total				Equipment		Trip $		# Trips		Total				Equipment		Trip $		# Trips		Total				Equipment		Trip $		# Trips		total

				no bid		no bid				no bid				min 50 passenger		$3,800.00		70		$266,000.00				47 pass Van to Yakima		$898.50		70		$62,895.00				47 pass Vanc to Yakima		$898.50		70		$62,895.00				22 pass mini w/rest Vanc to George		$1,034.50		70		$72,415.00				22 pass mini w/rest Vanc to George		$1,034.50		70		$72,415.00

																								22 Pass mini w/restr  Yak to Chel		$648.00		70		$45,360.00				22 pass mini w/restr Yak to Wen		$771.85		70		$54,022.50				22 pass mini w/rest Topp to Pasco		$361.75		70		$25,322.50				10 pass van (no rest) Topp to Touchet		$365.00		70		$25,550.00

																								22 Pass mini w/restr Topp to Touc		$495.00		70		$34,650.00				    & Toppenish to Pasco										A+ Auto (no rest) George to Chelan		$280.00		70		$19,600.00				A+ Auto (no rest) George to Chelan		$280.00		70		$19,600.00

																																		A+ Auto (no rest) Pasco to Touchet		$262.50		70		$18,375.00				    & Pasco to Touchet		$122.50		70		$8,575.00

																										$2,041.60		70		$142,906.00				    & Wen to Chelan

								TOTAL:		no bid								TOTAL:		$266,000.00								TOTAL:		$142,905.00						$9,132.75		70		$135,292.50						$1,798.75		70		$125,912.50						$1,679.50		70		$117,565.00

																																						TOTAL:		$135,292.50								TOTAL:		$125,912.50								TOTAL:		$117,565.00

				"COST" POINTS:										"COST" POINTS:										"COST" POINTS:										rejected - no restroom										rejected - no restroom										rejected - no restroom

				Northbound		114								Northbound		600								Northbound		no bid

				Eastbound		no bid								Eastbound		84								Eastbound		600



				"NON COST" PTS:										"NON COST" PTS:										"NON COST" PTS:

				Northbound		252.5								Northbound		305.5								Northbound		no bid

				Eastbound		no bid								Eastbound		316.6								Eastbound		320



				TOTAL POINTS:										TOTAL POINTS:										TOTAL POINTS:

				Northbound		366.5								Northbound		905.5								Northbound		no bid

				Eastbound		no bid								Eastbound		400.6								Eastbound		920
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