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Category 1 – Dispensers includes Lottery Scratch ticket Dispensers for retail locations.

Ordering Instructions
	Schafer Systems, Inc		Take-A-Ticket
	POC: Teresa Immel		Tami Dennis
	teresa.immel@ownrev.com	info@tatinc.com
	641.742.5133			541.967.0433
					www.tatinc.com
	
Pricing Information
Please see the embedded price sheet for pricing information.
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Schafer Systems Take a Ticket
Item Product Description Units Qty Price Per Unit Price Per Unit


1 Scratch Ticket Dispenser Secured on the counter to display packs over terminal Each 1


400001080 6 Game OTS 225.00$                 
400002191 6 Game OTS 225.00$                 
400001081 6 Game OTS 220.00$                 website None Provided w/ Bid Submittal website www.tatinc.com
400001082 8 Game OTS 245.00$                 Federal ID 20-0447405 Federal ID 93-0923470
400001083 8 Game OTS 245.00$                 
400001084 8 Game OTS 240.00$                 
400001085 10 Game OTS 265.00$                 
400001086 10 Game OTS 265.00$                 
400001087 10 Game OTS 260.00$                 
400001088 12 Game OTS 280.00$                 
180003416 12 Game OTS 280.00$                 Minimum Orders N/A Minimum Orders N/A
400001089 12 Game OTS 275.00$                 Delivery Time 4-6 weeks ARO Delivery Time 4-6 weeks ARO
400001090 12 Game OTS 275.00$                 Payment Terms Net 30 days Payment Terms Net 30 days
400001091 12 Game OTS 275.00$                 
400001031 12 Game OTS 265.00$                 
180003417 12 Game OTS 255.00$                 
190003143 12 Game OTS 255.00$                 
190003137 12 Game OTS 255.00$                 
180003295 16 Game OTS 285.00$                 
400001092 16 Game OTS 285.00$                 
400001094 16 Game OTS 275.00$                 
190003138 16 Game OTS 285.00$                 
400001093 16 Game OTS 275.00$                 
400001030 16 Game OTS 270.00$                 
400001095 20 Game OTS 310.00$                 
400001096 20 Game OTS 310.00$                 
400001098 20 Game OTS 305.00$                 
100004762 20 Game OTS 310.00$                 
100001097 20 Game OTS 305.00$                 
400001099 20 Game OTS 295.00$                 
400001100 24 Game OTS 340.00$                 
400001101 24 Game OTS 340.00$                 
400001103 24 Game OTS 335.00$                 
190003140 24 Game OTS 340.00$                 
400001102 24 Game OTS 335.00$                 
400001104 24 Game OTS 325.00$                 
400002106 30 Game OTS 365.00$                 
190003124 30 Game OTS 365.00$                 


OTD-14 14 game Over the Terminal Dispenser 194.43$                 
OTD-16 16 game Over the Terminal Dispenser 222.20$                 
OTD-18 18 game Over the Terminal Dispenser 247.45$                 
OTD-20 20 game Over the Terminal Dispenser 266.64$                 
OTD-22 22 game Over the Terminal Dispenser 277.75$                 
OTD-24 24 game Over the Terminal Dispenser 333.30$                 
OTD-26 26 game Over the Terminal Dispenser 360.57$                 
OTD-28 28 game Over the Terminal Dispenser 388.85$                 
OTD-32 32 game Over the Terminal Dispenser 404.00$                 


Shipping will be at contractor's cost. Added 
as a separate line item.


Ordering POC


Credit Card 
Acceptance


Yes (No specifics provided)


Freight Shipping will be at contractor's cost. Added 
as a separate line item.


Take - A - Ticket


Payment Address


Take A Ticket, Inc
Attn: Tami Dennis
130 NE Montgomer St
Albany, OR 97321


Credit Card 
Acceptance


Yes (Visa, Master Card)


Freight


Ordering POC


Name: Teresa Immel                                                                                                                               
e-mail: teresa.immel@ownrev.com
Phone: 641.742.5133
Address: 1000 Flag Road 
                   Adair, IA 50002


Name: Tami Dennis                                                                                                                              
e-mail: info@tatinc.com
Phone: 541.967.0433
Address: 130 NE Montgomery St
                   Albany, OR 97321


Schafer Systems, Inc


Payment Address


Schafer Systems Inc.
Attn: Shannon Lee
1000 Flag Road
Adair, IA 50002



http://www.tatinc.com/





OTD-34 34 game Over the Terminal Dispenser 429.25$                 
OTD-36 36 game Over the Terminal Dispenser 454.50$                 


2 Wall- Mount Dispenser Smaller units can be connected Each 1
190000022 Wall Mount Dispenser (SBS) 30.50$                   


TAT MODEL 502 2 game Wall Mount Dispenser 43.43$                   
TAT MODEL 503 3 game Wall Mount Dispenser 57.57$                   
TAT MODEL 504 4 game Wall Mount Dispenser 64.64$                   
TAT MODEL 505 5 game Wall Mount Dispenser 79.79$                   
TAT MODEL 506 6 game Wall Mount Dispenser 95.95$                   


TAT MODEL 5002 2 game Wall Mount Dispenser - Waterfall 39.39$                   
TAT MODEL 5004 4 game Wall Mount Dispenser - Waterfall 55.05$                   
TAT MODEL 5012 12 game Wall Mount Dispenser - Waterfall 151.50$                 


3 Scratch Ticket Display A display board Each 1
400001637 12 Game Ticket Menu Board (Taped 49.00$                   
400001522 16 Game Ticket Menu Board (Taped 60.00$                   
400001525 20 Game Ticket Menu Board (Taped 69.00$                   
400001527 24 Game Ticket Menu Board (Taped 77.00$                   
400005234 30 Game Ticket Menu Board (Taped 85.00$                   
400001529 Easel (works with all Ticket Menu Boards) 25.50$                   


TAT MODEL MB-12 12 game Menu Baord - Celing, Wall or Counter mount 76.76$                   


TAT MODEL MB-16 16 game Menu Baord - Celing, Wall or Counter mount 84.34$                   


TAT MODEL MB-20 20 game Menu Baord - Celing, Wall or Counter mount 105.55$                 


TAT MODEL MB-24 24 game Menu Baord - Celing, Wall or Counter mount 126.25$                 


TAT MODEL MB-28 28 game Menu Baord - Celing, Wall or Counter mount 147.46$                 


TAT MODEL MB-32 32 game Menu Baord - Celing, Wall or Counter mount 168.67$                 


TAT MODEL MB-36 36 game Menu Baord - Celing, Wall or Counter mount 172.71$                 


TAT MODEL RD-8 8 game Rotating Display 37.37$                   
TAT MODEL RD-12 12 game Rotating Display 47.47$                   
TAT MODEL RD-16 16 game Rotating Display 58.58$                   
TAT MODEL RD-20 20 game Rotating Display 70.70$                   
TAT MODEL RD-24 24 game Rotating Display - Tall 82.82$                   
TAT MODEL RD-24 24 game Rotating Display - Cube 82.82$                   


4 Under the Counter Scratch Dispenser Unit for packs to be sold and that are displayed on the Each 1
400001872 12 game Promoter with Ticket Menu Board 235.00$                 
180003406 16 game Promoter with Ticket Menu Board 265.00$                 
180003407 20 Game Promoter with Ticket Menu Board 75.00$                   
180003408 24 Game Promoter with Ticket Menu Board 295.00$                 


TAT REMOTE BASE-12 12 game Remote Base Dispenser-Under Counter 144.43$                 
TAT REMOTE BASE-16 16 game Remote Base Dispenser-Under Counter 171.70$                 
TAT REMOTE BASE-20 20 game Remote Base Dispenser-Under Counter 193.92$                 
TAT REMOTE BASE-24 24 game Remote Base Dispenser-Under Counter 222.20$                 
TAT REMOTE BASE-28 28 game Remote Base Dispenser-Under Counter 277.75$                 
TAT REMOTE BASE-32 32 game Remote Base Dispenser-Under Counter 299.97$                 
TAT REMOTE BASE-36 36 game Remote Base Dispenser-Under Counter 327.24$                 


5 In- Counter Dispenser Customer able to view available tickets in dispenser Each 1
400001608 12 Game Pop Up In Counter 310.00$                 
400001609 16 Game Pop Up In Counter 335.00$                 
400001610 20 Game Pop Up In Counter 345.00$                 







400001611 24 Game Pop Up In Counter 350.00$                 
400004277 32 Game Pop Up In Counter 370.00$                 
190002042 12 Game Staggered Tray ICD 260.00$                 
190002043 16 Game Staggered Tray ICD 280.00$                 


TAT MODEL 412 12 game Original Counter no light 196.95$                 
TAT MODEL 416 16 game Original Counter no light 224.22$                 
TAT MODEL 420 20 game Original In Counter no light 239.88$                 
TAT MODEL 412L 12 game Original In Counter with light 224.22$                 
TAT MODEL 416L 16 game Original In Counter with light 251.49$                 
TAT MODEL 420L 20 game Original In Counter with lights 291.89$                 


TAT MODEL 412-FW 12 game Front Window with light 268.16$                 
TAT MODEL 416-FW 16 game Front Window with light 324.21$                 
TATMODEL 420-FW 20 game Front Window with light 333.30$                 
TAT MODEL 424-FW 24 game Front Window with light 466.62$                 
TAT MODEL 412-U 12 game Ultimate top view 197.96$                 
TAT MODEL 416-U 16 game Ultimate top view 225.23$                 
TAT MODEL 424-U 24 game Ultimate top view 287.85$                 


420-FW SLANT 20 game Front Window with light Slant w/ light 434.30$                 
424-FW SLANT 24 game Front Window with light Slant w/ light 454.50$                 


ICM-12 (reg. or L) 12 game Top View, Rod Display 233.82$                 
ICM-16 (reg or L) 16 game Top View, Rod Display 256.54$                 
ICM-20 (reg or L) 20 game Top View, Rod Display 269.67$                 
ICM-24 (reg. or L) 24 game Top View, Rod Display 295.93$                 
ICM-30 (reg. or L) 30 game Top View, Rod Display 371.68$                 
ICM-36 (reg. or L) 36 game Top View, Rod Display 439.35$                 


ICM-12(i) (reg. or L) 12 game Top View, IVY Display 233.82$                 
ICM-16(i) (reg. or L) 16 game Top View, IVY Display 256.54$                 
ICM-20(i) (reg. or L) 20 game Top View, IVY Display 269.67$                 
ICM-24(i) (reg. or L) 24 game Top View, IVY Display 295.93$                 
ICM-28(i) (reg. or L) 28 game Top View, IVY Display 360.57$                 
ICM-32(i) (reg. or L) 32 game Top View, IVY Display 399.96$                 
ICM-30(i) (reg. or L) 30 game Top View, IVY Display 371.68$                 
ICM-36(i) (reg. or L) 36 game Top View, IVY Display 439.35$                 


6 On-Counter Dispenser Single interlocking dispenser Each 1
400005064 Single Back Wall Dispenser 28.65$                   
190001447 Single Snap-together 4" MM 15.00$                   
190000005 Single Snap-together 6" MM 14.00$                   
190000007 Single Snap-together Bingo MM 16.50$                   
190000002 Dual Snap-together 4" MM 17.00$                   
190000004 Dual Snap-together 6" MM 18.50$                   
110000032 Dual Snap-together Bingo MM 18.50$                   
400000520 Dual Snap-together 5" MM 27.50$                   
400004281 GEN2 Dual Snap-together 6" MM 26.00$                   
110001502 Single Beige Taped Lockable Slide Mount 4.90$                     
110001454 Dual Beige Taped Lockable Slide Mount 5.40$                     


TAT MODEL 113 113 SINGLE STACKABLE 18.69$                   
113 2 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 2 games 36.36$                   
113 3 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 3 games 54.54$                   
113 4 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 4 games 71.71$                   
113 5 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 5 games 89.89$                   
113 6 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 6 games 108.07$                 
113 7 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 7 games 125.24$                 
113 8 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 8 games 145.44$                 
113 9 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 9 games 158.57$                 


113 10 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 10 games 164.13$                 







113 12 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 12 games 197.46$                 
113 14 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 14 games 229.78$                 
113 15 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 15 games 246.19$                 
113 16 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 16 games 262.60$                 
113 18 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 18 games 295.43$                 
113 20 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 20 games 328.25$                 
113 21 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 21 games 344.66$                 
113 22 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 22 games 361.08$                 
113 24 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 24 games 393.90$                 
113 25 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 25 games 410.31$                 
113 26 w/ box base 113 STACK any configuration 26 games 426.73$                 
113 27 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 27 games 443.14$                 
113 28 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 28 games 459.55$                 
113 30 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 30 games 492.38$                 
113 32 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 32 games 525.20$                 
113 33 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 33 games 541.61$                 
113 34 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 34 games 558.03$                 
113 35 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 35 games 574.44$                 
113 36 w/box base 113 STACK any configuration 36 games 590.85$                 


7 In-Counter Display
Display available for mounting within countertop with 
and without light


Each 1


400001608 12 Game Pop Up In Counter 310.00$                 
400001609 16 Game Pop Up In Counter 335.00$                 
400001610 20 Game Pop Up In Counter 345.00$                 
400001611 24 Game Pop Up In Counter 350.00$                 
400004277 32 Game Pop Up In Counter 370.00$                 
190002042 12 Game Staggered Tray ICD 260.00$                 
190002043 16 Game Staggered Tray ICD 280.00$                 


DISPLAY UNDER GLASS 16 IVY IVY Display Under Glass 16 game - no light 90.90$                   
DISPLAY UNDER GLASS 20 IVY IVY Display Under Glass 20 game - no light 93.93$                   
DISPLAY UNDER GLASS 24 IVY IVY Display Under Glass 24 game - no light 96.96$                   
DISPLAY UNDER GLASS 28 IVY IVY Display Under Glass 28 game - no light 146.45$                 
DISPLAY UNDER GLASS 32 IVY IVY Display Under Glass 32 game - no light 172.71$                 


DISPLAY UNDER GLASS 16 IVY w/LT IVY Display Under Glass 16 game - with Triple LED 126.25$                 
DISPLAY UNDER GLASS 20 IVY w/LT IVY Display Under Glass 20 game - with Triple LED 129.28$                 
DISPLAY UNDER GLASS 24 IVY w/LT IVY Display Under Glass 24 game - with Triple LED 132.31$                 
DISPLAY UNDER GLASS 28 IVY w/LT IVY Display Under Glass 28 game - with Triple LED 181.80$                 
DISPLAY UNDER GLASS 32 IVY w/LT IVY Display Under Glass 32 game - with Triple LED 208.06$                 


8 In-Lane/Check writer dispenser Smaller units for placement at grocery checkout Each 1
400005158 2 Game Check Writer 65.50$                   
400002042 4 Game Check Writer 90.50$                   


402-N 2 game Check Writer 71.71$                   
403-N 3 game Check Writer 78.78$                   
404-N 4 game Check Writer 85.85$                   
405-N 5 game Check Writer 91.91$                   
406-N 6 game Check Writer 96.96$                   


402-NP 2 game Check Writer with platform 78.78$                   
403-NP 3 game Check Writer with platform 85.85$                   
404-NP 4 game Check Writer with platform 91.91$                   
405-NP 5 game Check Writer with platform 97.97$                   
406-NP 6 game Check Writer with platform 103.02$                 


9 Glass 1/16th X 18 X 16 inches Each 1 NO BID 18.18$                   
10 Glass 1/16th X 18 X 18 inches Each 1 NO BID 18.18$                   
11 Glass 1/16th X 18 X 19 inches Each 1 NO BID 18.18$                   
12 Glass 1/8th X 18 X 16 inches Each 1 NO BID NO BID







13 Glass 1/8th X 18 X 18 inches Each 1 NO BID
190003042 Glass (17.795 x17.795x1/8) 18.90$                   


14 Glass 1/8th X 18 X 19 inches Each 1 NO BID NO BID
15 Glas (in-lane w/ Check writer) Check writer glass - added by Take a Ticket Each 1


402N/NP Glass 5/32 x 11 3/16 x 11" 18.18$                   
403N/NP Glass 5/32 x 11 3/16 x 15 1/4" 18.18$                   
404N/NP Glass 5/32 x 11 3/16 x 19 1/2" 18.18$                   
405N/NP Glass 5/32 x 11 3/16 x 23 3/4" 29.29$                   
406N/NP Glass 5/32 x 11 3/16 x 28" 29.29$                   
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