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Contract 06815
Pricing and Ordering 
Double click boxes to open pricing spreadsheet with contractor ordering contact information

	Contractors:
	Alpine Products Inc.                                   
[image: image1.emf]Alpine pricing.xlsx


Categories Awarded

Original Request; A, B, C, D, E, G, H, I
Additional Request; A, B, C, D, E, F, G, H
Apex Universal Inc.                                    
[image: image2.emf]ApexUniversal  pricing.xlsx


Categories Awarded
Original Request; A, B, C, D, G, 
Flint Trading Inc.                                        
[image: image3.emf]Flint Trading  Pricing.xlsx


Categories Awarded 
Additional Request; A, B, C, D, E, F, G, H
Partner Construction Products                 
[image: image4.emf]Partner pricing.xlsx


Categories Awarded 
Original Request; H
Pexco LLC                                                   
[image: image5.emf]Pexco pricing.xlsx


Categories Awarded 
Original Request; G
Specialty Construction Supply                
[image: image6.emf]Specialty pricing.xlsx


Categories Awarded 
Original Request; B, C, E, F
Traffic Safety Supply Co.                          
[image: image7.emf]TSSCo pricing.xls

                      
Categories Awarded

Original Request; A,C
Additional Request; A, B, C, D, E, F, G, H


	
	


Double click boxes to open pricing spreadsheet with contractor ordering contact information
	DES Contract Specialist:
	Mark Roush
Master Contracts and Consulting

(360) 407-9311
mailto:mark.roush@des.wa.gov
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		Flint Trading Ordering Info

		Name/Email: Shannon Franklin  
                      sales@flinttrading.com
Address: 115 Todd Court
                Thomasville, NC 27360
Phone: (336) 308-3781 


		  Price Sheet, Flint Trading

		Category A



		Pre-formed fused thermoplastic with skid optics, .125 mil thickness, color: white

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape		Model: PreMark



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each		Unit Price/ Each

		1		4" wide x 36" long		$4.96		$   5.31

		2		8" wide x 36" long		$9.90		$   10.58

		3		12" wide x 36" long		$15.02		$   15.88

		4		24" wide x 36" long		$30.02		$   31.75









		Category B



		Pre-formed fused thermoplastic with skid optics, .125 mil thickness, color:  yellow

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape		Model: PreMark



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each		Unit Price/ Each

		1		4" wide x 36" long		$5.20		$5.63

		2		8" wide x 36" long		$10.31		$12.16

		3		12" wide x 36" long		$15.72		$16.69

		4		24" wide x 36" long		$31.43		$33.37









		Category C



		WA Low Speed combo arrow. Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics. 13’ 4” tall X 3’ 4” wide

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape		Model: PreMark



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each		Unit Price/ Each

		1		Hand Kits, Left		$145.52		$154.08

		2		Hand Kits, Right		$145.52		$154.08













		Category D



		WA Low Speed turn arrow.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics 8' tall x 2'8" wide

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape		Model: PreMark



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each		Unit Price/ Each

		1		Hand Kits, Left		$76.25		$80.73

		2		Hand Kits, Right		$76.25		$80.73









		Category E



		WA Low Speed straight arrow.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics 8' tall x 2'6" wide

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape		Model: PreMark



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each		Unit Price/ Each

		1		8' tall x 2'6" wide		$79.09		$83.75









		Category F



		Bicycle symbol.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape		Model: PreMark



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each		Unit Price/ Each

		1		4' tall x 2'		$90.81		$98.89











		Category G



		Rail road crossing kit. Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape		Model: PreMark



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each		Unit Price/ Each

		1		Rail road crossing kit		$421.52		$455.40









		Category H



		Pre-formed thermoplastic letter with skip optics

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape		Model: PreMark



		Item		Description		Unit Price/lb.		Unit Price/ Each

		1		8' tall		$63.50		$68.13
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Sheet1

		Pexco Ordering Info

		Name/e-mail: erika.whitney@pexco.com                                        Address: 3110 70th Ave E Tacoma, WA 98424                                Phone:   253-284-8000

		 Price Sheet, Pexco

		Category G

		Temporary Flexible Raised Pavement Marker (RPM)

		Mfg.:Pexco/Davids				Model:932



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		Temporary RPM Type W with protective cover		$0.29

		2		Temporary RPM Type YY with protective cover		$0.31






_1528717611.xls
Price Sheets

		Traffic Safety Supply Ordering Info

		Name/e-mail:  Tammy Stonebrink  tstonebrink@tssco.com                Address:  2324 SE Umatilla St. Portland, OR 97202                                      Phone:  503-235-8531

		Price Sheet, Traffic Safety Supply

		Category A

		Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 1, Non-reflective

						Unit Price/ Each

		Item		Description		Interstate Sales diamond back polypropolene

		1		RPM Type 1W		$0.45

		2		RPM Type 1Y		$0.47

		Category C

		4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens

						Unit Price/ Each		Unit Price/ Each		Unit Price/ Each

		Item		Description		Ray-O-Lite AA ARC		Ray-O-Lite RS ARC		3M Series 290

		1		RPM Type 2YY		$1.08		$1.05		$0.81

		2		RPM Type 2W		$1.06		$1.04		$0.79

		3		RPM Type 2Y		$1.06		$1.04		$0.79

		4		RPM Type 2WR		$1.10		$1.07		$0.81

		5		RPM Type 2YR		$1.10		$1.07		$0.81

		Price Sheet added by Solicitation Amendment 2

		Category A

		Pre-formed fused thermoplastic with skid optics, .125 mil thickness, color: white

						Unit Price/ Each

		Item		Description		FT PreMark Type B

		1		4" wide x 36" long		$5.00

		2		8" wide x 36" long		$10.00

		3		12" wide x 36" long		$14.99

		4		24" wide x 36" long		$29.99

		Category B

		Pre-formed fused thermoplastic with skid optics, .125 mil thickness, color:  yellow

						Unit Price/ Each

		Item		Description		FT PreMark Type B

		1		4" wide x 36" long		$5.36

		2		8" wide x 36" long		$8.82

		3		12" wide x 36" long		$12.98

		4		24" wide x 36" long		$25.96

		Category C

		WA Low Speed combo arrow. Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics. 13’ 4” tall X 3’ 4” wide

						Unit Price/ Each

		Item		Description		FT PreMark Type B

		1		Hand Kits, Left		$145.52

		2		Hand Kits, Right		$145.52

		Category D

		WA Low Speed turn arrow.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics 8' tall x 2'8" wide

						Unit Price/ Each

		Item		Description		FT PreMark Type B

		1		Hand Kits, Left		$76.25

		2		Hand Kits, Right		$76.25

		Category E

		WA Low Speed straight arrow.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics 8' tall x 2'6" wide

						Unit Price/ Each

		Item		Description		FT PreMark Type B

		1		8' tall x 2'6" wide		$79.09

		Category F

		Bicycle symbol.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics

						Unit Price/ Each

		Item		Description		FT PreMark Type B

		1		4' tall x 2'		$87.90

		Category G

		Rail road crossing kit. Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics

						Unit Price/ Each

		Item		Description		FT PreMark Type B

		1		Rail road crossing kit		$430.10

		Category H

		Pre-formed thermoplastic letter with skip optics

						Unit Price/ Each

		Item		Description		FT PreMark Type B

		1		8' tall		$57.50



&L&"Arial,Regular"&16Bid Tab #06815 
Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives&R&"Arial,Bold"&16Appendix B - Price Sheet



Minimum Order Requirements

		

		This section will not be evaluated.  Bidder is to list any minimum order requirements as a dollar amount not to exceed $3,500 for deliveries, FOB Destination Prepaid and Included.

		After award of contract, the contractor may charge the purchaser freight charges for orders that do not meet the minimum order requirements (FOB Destination Prepaid and Add to invoice).

		Customers are located throughout the State of Washington

		Delivery for the primary user (WSDOT) will be required at the following six Department of Transportation Regions on a demand basis:

						Northwest Region:		Washington State Department of Transportation

								6431 Corson Avenue South, Seattle, WA  98108

						North Central Region:		Washington State Department of Transportation

								1551 North Wenatchee Ave, Wenatchee, WA  98807

						Olympic Region:		Washington State Department of Transportation

								5720 Capitol Boulevard, Tumwater, WA  98501

						Southwest Region:		Washington State Department of Transportation

								4200 Main Street, Vancouver, WA  98663

						South Central Region:		Washington State Department of Transportation

								2809 Rudkin Road, Union Gap, WA  98903

						Eastern Region:		Washington State Department of Transportation

								2714 North Mayfair Street, Spokane, WA  99207

		Minimum order requirements per each district - by dollar amount not to exceed $3,500

		Section		Northwest Region		North Central Region		Olympic Region		Southwest Region		South Central Region		Eastern Region

		“A”

		“B”

		“C”

		“D”

		“E”

		“F”

		“G”

		“H”

		“I”



&L&"Arial,Regular"&14Invitation for Bid 06815
Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives&R&"Arial,Bold"&14Appendix B - Minimum Order Requirements

&C&P&RBidder's Company Name:____________________



Specifications

		

		General

		This contract shall furnish Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesive for the following categories:

		Category		Product

		A		Raised Pavement Marker, Type 1, Non-reflective

		B		4 x 4 inch Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective, Uncoated Lens

		C		4 x 4 inch Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant

		D		3.2 x 4.6 inch Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant

		E		Low Profile Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant

		F		Recessed Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant

		G		Temporary Flexible Pavement Marker

		H		Flexible Bituminous Adhesive for Pavement Markers

		I		Liquid Hot Applied Thermoplastic, Type A

		Colors

		Colors for Raised Pavement Markers shall be consistent with the following table:

		RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER TYPE 1 COLORS

		Type 1W		White

		Type 1Y		Yellow

		RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER TYPE 2 COLORS

		Type 2YY		Yellow and Yellow

		Type 2W		White – one side only

		Type 2Y		Yellow – one side only

		Type 2WR		White and Red

		Type 2YR		Yellow and Red

		TEMPORARY FLEXIBLE PAVEMENT MARKER

		REFLECTIVE TAPE COLORS

		Type W		White – one side only

		Type YY		Yellow – both sides

		Pre-qualified Products

		Raised pavement markers and adhesives shall conform to the requirements of the 2014 Washington State Department of Transportation (WSDOT) Standard Specifications for Road, Bridge and Municipal Construction and be listed on the Qualified Product List (QPL).  Information about the WSDOT Specifications for Road, Bridge and Municipal Construction can be found at the following web address:

		http://www.wsdot.wa.gov/Publications/Manuals/M41-10.htm

		Information about the WSDOT QPL can be found at the following web address:

		http://www.wsdot.wa.gov/biz/mats/QPL/QPL.cfm

		The following Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives have been pre-qualified and listed on the QPL by the Washington State Department of Transportation:

		Category A - Raised Pavement Marker, Type 1, Non-reflective

		Alpine Products Inc. – Auburn, WA

		Alpine Model “ANR-W & ANR-Y”

		Apex Universal Inc. - Santa Fe Springs, CA

		Model “929 ABS”

		Interstates Sales - Auburn, CA

		Model “Diamond Back Polypropylene”

		Novabrite LLC - Livermore, CA

		Model “ADOT-W and ADOT-Y ABS”

		Tenacity Inc. – Sedro Wooley, WA

		Model “RPM T1”

		Three D Traffic Works, Inc. - Burbank-CA

		Pathfinder Model TD 10500

		Category B – 4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective with uncoated lens

		Ennis Paint – Niles, IL

		Stimsonite Model 88 (4”x 4”x 0.7”)

		Ray-O-Lite, Division of Pac-Tec, Inc. – Newark, OH

		Ray-O-Lite Model AA (4”x 4”x 0.7”)

		Tenacity Inc. – Sedro Wooley, WA

		Model “RPM T2” (4”x 4”x 0.7”)

		Category C – 4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective with abrasion resistant lens

		Apex Universal Inc. - Santa Fe Springs, CA

		Model 921 AR (4”x 4”x 0.75”)

		Category C - continued

		Ennis Paint – Niles, IL

		Stimsonite Model 911(4”x 4”x 0.7”)

		Ray-O-Lite, Division of Pac-Tec, Inc., - Newark, OH

		Ray-O-Lite Model AA-ARC II (4”x 4”x 0.7”) and Model RS-ARC (4”x 4”x 0.7”)

		Category D – 3.2” x 4.6” Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective with abrasion resistant lens

		Ennis Paint – Niles, IL

		Stimsonite Model C80 (3.2”x 4.6”x 0.66”)

		Category E –  Low Profile Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective with abrasion resistant lens

		Ennis Paint – Niles, IL

		Stimsonite Model 948 (2.3”x 4.7”x 0.5”)

		Ray-O-Lite, Division of Pac-Tec, Inc. – Newark, OH

		Ray-O-Lite Model 2002 (2.3”x 4.7”x 0.5”)

		Category F – Recessed Raised Pavement Marker, Type 2, Reflective with abrasion resistant lens

		(For recessed application only)

		Ennis Paint – Niles, IL

		Stimsonite Model 944SB (2”x 4”x 0.5”)

		Ray-O-Lite, Division of Pac-Tec, Inc. – Newark, OH

		Ray-O-Lite Model 2004 (2”x 4”x 0.5”)

		Category G - Temporary Flexible Raised Pavement Marker with clear polyvinyl chloride protective cover

		Apex Universal Inc. – Santa Fe Springs, CA

		Seal Coat Marker

		Pexco, Davidson Traffic Control Products – Tacoma, WA

		Model TRPM

		Category H - Flexible Bituminous Adhesive for Pavement Markers

		Flexible bituminous pavement marker adhesive for raised pavement markers shall conform to the requirements of Amended Section 9-02.1 (8) of the 2008 WSDOT Standard Specifications for Road, Bridge and Municipal Construction.

		Material shall be packaged in self-releasing disposable containers that will stack properly.  The containers shall be divided into compartments so that three or four equal individual parts are obtained from each container.  Package dividers shall be free of over-spill material providing for easy separation and removal.  The label for the container shall clearly show the manufacturer, quantity, lot or batch number, and an indication that the material is flexible bituminous adhesive for pavement markers.

		The following flexible bituminous pavement marker adhesives have been pre-qualified by the Washington State department of Transportation:

		Crafco Inc. – Chandler, AZ

		Hot Applied Flexible Pavement Marker Adhesive, Part No. 34270

		Henry Company – Elk Grove, CA

		Flexible DOT Stick

		Category I - Pavement Marking Plastic Type A: Liquid Hot Applied Thermoplastic

		Ennis Paint – Niles, IL

		Stimsonite Model BC2000



&L&"Arial,Regular"&16Invitation for Bid 06815
Raised Pavement Markers and Adhesives&R&"Arial,Bold"&16Appendix B - Specifications

&C&P

http://www.wsdot.wa.gov/biz/mats/QPL/QPL.cfm

http://www.wsdot.wa.gov/biz/mats/QPL/QPL.cfm

http://www.wsdot.wa.gov/Publications/Manuals/M41-10.htm




Sheet1

		Apex Universal Ordering Info

		Name/e-mail: sales@apexmarker.com         Address: 11033 Forest Place Santa Fe Springs, CA 90670                                                                        Phone: 562-944-8878

		 Price Sheet, Apex Universal

		Category A



		Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 1, Non-reflective

		Mfg.: 				Model:929ABS		Model:929PP



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 1W		$0.44		$0.34

		2		RPM Type 1Y		$0.44		$0.34









		Category B



		4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Uncoated Lens



		Mfg.:				Model:921



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		$0.83

		2		RPM Type 2W		$0.79

		3		RPM Type 2Y		$0.79

		4		RPM Type 2WR		$0.83

		5		RPM Type 2YR		$0.83









		Category C



		4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens



		Mfg.:E-F				Model:921AR



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		$0.86

		2		RPM Type 2W		$0.82

		3		RPM Type 2Y		$0.82

		4		RPM Type 2WR		$0.86

		5		RPM Type 2YR		$0.86













		Category D



		3.2” x 4.6” Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens

		Mfg.:				Model:828AR



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		$0.77

		2		RPM Type 2W		$0.69

		3		RPM Type 2Y		$0.69

		4		RPM Type 2WR		$0.77

		5		RPM Type 2YR		$0.77









		Category E



		Low Profile Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens

		Mfg.:				Model:948



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		No Bid

		2		RPM Type 2W		No Bid

		3		RPM Type 2Y		No Bid

		4		RPM Type 2WR		No Bid

		5		RPM Type 2YR		No Bid









		Category F



		Recessed Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens

		Mfg.:				Model:



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		No Bid

		2		RPM Type 2W		No Bid

		3		RPM Type 2Y		No Bid

		4		RPM Type 2WR		No Bid

		5		RPM Type 2YR		No Bid











		Category G



		Temporary Flexible Raised Pavement Marker (RPM)

		Mfg.:Pexco/Davids				Model:932



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		Temporary RPM Type W with protective cover		$0.34

		2		Temporary RPM Type YY with protective cover		$0.36
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Sheet1

		Specialty Construction Supply Ordering Info

		Name/Email:Michael Zawacki mzawacki@specialtysupply.com                                                              Address: 348 NW 13th Place
Meridian, ID  83642                                                                                                          Phone:208-322-6800 


		 Price Sheet, Specialty

		Category B

		4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Uncoated Lens



		Mfg.:Ray-O-Lite 				Model:AA

		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		$0.90

		2		RPM Type 2W		$0.90

		3		RPM Type 2Y		$0.90

		4		RPM Type 2WR		$0.90

		5		RPM Type 2YR		$0.90

		Category C

		4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens



		Mfg.:Ray-O-Lite				Model:RS ARC

		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		$0.90

		2		RPM Type 2W		$0.90

		3		RPM Type 2Y		$0.90

		4		RPM Type 2WR		$0.90

		5		RPM Type 2YR		$0.90

		Category E

		Low Profile Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens

		Mfg.:Ray-O-Lite				Model:2002 ARC

		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		$0.90

		2		RPM Type 2W		$0.90

		3		RPM Type 2Y		$0.90

		4		RPM Type 2WR		$0.90

		5		RPM Type 2YR		$0.90

		Category F

		Recessed Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens

		Mfg.:Ray-O-Lite				Model:2004s-arc

		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		$0.93

		2		RPM Type 2W		$0.93

		3		RPM Type 2Y		$0.93

		4		RPM Type 2WR		$0.93

		5		RPM Type 2YR		$0.93
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Sheet1

		Partner Construction Products Ordering Info 

		Name: Seth Dawson
Address: 25223 74th Ave. S Unit B Kent, WA 98032
Phone:253-850-1144


		 Price Sheet, Partner

		Category H

		Flexible Bituminous Adhesive for Pavement Markers

		Mfg.:CRAFCO				Model:Flexible Marker Adhesive

		Item		Description		Unit Price/lb.

		1		Flexible Bituminous Adhesive for Pavement Markers		$0.95


















Sheet1

		Alpine Products Ordering Info

		   Name/e-mail: joe@alpinemarkings.com   Address: 550 3rd st sw, Auburn, WA 98001         Phone 253-351-9828

		 Price Sheet, Alpine Products

		Category A



		Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 1, Non-reflective

		Mfg.: E-F				Model:808131B10



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 1W		$0.49

		2		RPM Type 1Y		$0.50





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.



		Category B



		4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Uncoated Lens



		Mfg.:E-F				Model:88



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		$0.91

		2		RPM Type 2W		$0.90

		3		RPM Type 2Y		$0.90

		4		RPM Type 2WR		$0.99

		5		RPM Type 2YR		$0.99





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.



		Category C



		4” x 4” Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens



		Mfg.:E-F				Model:911



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		$0.99

		2		RPM Type 2W		$0.98

		3		RPM Type 2Y		$0.98

		4		RPM Type 2WR		$1.01

		5		RPM Type 2YR		$1.01





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.







		Category D



		3.2” x 4.6” Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:C80



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		$0.94

		2		RPM Type 2W		$0.93

		3		RPM Type 2Y		$0.93

		4		RPM Type 2WR		$1.04

		5		RPM Type 2YR		$1.04





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.



		Category E



		Low Profile Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:948



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		$0.97

		2		RPM Type 2W		$0.95

		3		RPM Type 2Y		$0.95

		4		RPM Type 2WR		$1.10

		5		RPM Type 2YR		$1.10





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.



		Category F



		Recessed Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type 2, Reflective, Abrasion Resistant Lens

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		RPM Type 2YY		N/B

		2		RPM Type 2W		N/B

		3		RPM Type 2Y		N/B

		4		RPM Type 2WR		N/B

		5		RPM Type 2YR		N/B





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.





		Category G



		Temporary Flexible Raised Pavement Marker (RPM)

		Mfg.:Pexco/Davids				Model:TPRM



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		Temporary RPM Type W with protective cover		$0.42

		2		Temporary RPM Type YY with protective cover		$0.43





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.



		Category H



		Flexible Bituminous Adhesive for Pavement Markers

		Mfg.:Henry Flexible Bituminous				Model:



		Item		Description		Unit Price/lb.

		1		Flexible Bituminous Adhesive for Pavement Markers		$0.89





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.



		Category I



		Pavement Marking Plastic Type A: Liquid Hot Applied Thermoplastic

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:BC2000



		Item		Description		Unit Price/lb.

		1		BC 2000 White		$0.89

		2		BC 2000 Yellow		$0.91





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.



		Price Sheet added by Solicitation Amendment 2



		Category A



		Pre-formed fused thermoplastic with skid optics, .125 mil thickness, color: white

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		4" wide x 36" long		$4.94

		2		8" wide x 36" long		$9.90

		3		12" wide x 36" long		$15.02

		4		24" wide x 36" long		$30.02





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.



		Category B



		Pre-formed fused thermoplastic with skid optics, .125 mil thickness, color:  yellow

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		4" wide x 36" long		$5.20

		2		8" wide x 36" long		$10.40

		3		12" wide x 36" long		$15.60

		4		24" wide x 36" long		$31.43





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.



		Category C



		WA Low Speed combo arrow. Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics. 13’ 4” tall X 3’ 4” wide

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		Hand Kits, Left		$144.98

		2		Hand Kits, Right		$144.98





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.







		Category D



		WA Low Speed turn arrow.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics 8' tall x 2'8" wide

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		Hand Kits, Left		$77.71

		2		Hand Kits, Right		$77.71





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.



		Category E



		WA Low Speed straight arrow.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics 8' tall x 2'6" wide

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		8' tall x 2'6" wide		$78.82





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.



		Category F



		Bicycle symbol.  Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		4' tall x 2'		$78.82





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.





		Category G



		Rail road crossing kit. Pre-formed thermoplastic with skid optics

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape



		Item		Description		Unit Price/ Each

		1		Rail road crossing kit		$421.51





		(*)  Indicates estimated usage for evaluation purposes only, as actual usage is not available.



		Category H



		Pre-formed thermoplastic letter with skip optics

		Mfg.:E-F				Model:Hot Tape



		Item		Description		Unit Price/lb.

		1		8' tall		$61.25












